A Ho Eto Teto-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

d ShT
The Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY
AW [[—EUE 3—3U-WUE (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & WehtioTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

W, 451] ¢ foeett, gewfaar, S 30, 2016/31M91g 9, 1938
No. 451] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JUNE 30, 2016/ASHADHA 91938

FRIRE HE FAET
g
7% fawelt, 30 S, 2016

ar#.fA. 646(st).—FT TXER, FAAT afafaaE, 2013 (2013 F7 18) H o™ 469 HY
SUETRT (1) R ITLTRT (2) FRT T& ARFAT T TART FIT U AT (Faferehrg wriHant 1 FAgfe o
grfeertaer) =, 2014 =7 i Ferram Fwe F foru e e a=rdh g, sraia -

1. (1) = et w1 "t am el (e s f Pl o ofatas) s
7w, 2016 2

(2) ¥ R o § YT i G g i
2. FUAT (yeerhrT FwHET B e o afiatas) fem, 2014 (FE a8t @85 gaa g R
FETIATE) ¥ -
() == (3) ®, “A=T FEFE AEFEET (HEa), T qEE @i g B afey
(e srfrertRat & =9 R S

3. 4o e % g (5) §,-
(F) ST (1) F == (v), (vi), (vii) 3T (ix) T (xi) FT 09 =T ST
(@) sufaw (2) &

(F) “SH TAF FHAT HT ATH” 9Teat F L T 918 TRAAF F aqEr fid @ s=rfat
F AT I T FHAT T ATH 9758 TG SATU|

3273 G1/2016 (1)




2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(@) IUEE () § “HTS AT FIU 9Tea1 6 €I I “UF FUE &l A1 €907 9768 T AT

(M ST (i) ¥ “wiaHTe 9T 9T ®YU” 9Teal F T 9T “VIAHTE AMS AT = g9 €90
9Teg T STUAT|

4. 71 e % weT "t uwee-1 % fore Rmferfea s @ suw, s -

yaafiw Fwifis & AR
1 fRaor

9= €. THAR1

[t afafaw, 2013 f ax 197 =ik
ATV ¥ 9y afda aRT 196 ¥ g
# o Fut (weterht FifdE i A ek
qifesfa=) fRew, 2014 % fRaw 3 ¥ sqaor

a9 ifee Fq F g A ot deet o

1. (F) *HIAT T FILAE TEATT HEAT (FTHATETT) ..o (@ gfa)
(@) ot =t ST TR AT (STRTTA). .o,

b I e i o v AR
() T o TSR STITAT BT TAT Lo

3. () M3 wgATT FEAT (SAEUA) AT AAFHL

AT FTAT FEAT (FrOUT) AT FEETAT HETT oo
(T) T oo
4, TEATH e, 1o L e ARIF EUENEEAEESED
5. *AR9TH HEo FTT HFeT B TG e (Fem/mrg/ad)
6. *FAfRE T T TE o (Fem/mTR/ad)

7. areertas gfgq Fege o oad
@) TR TRATE e wiaag

LATT (B H) e
i, TATAT (B H) e



[ 9 [I-@vg 3(i)] AT ehl TSTYA ¢ STHERUT 3

HL (& ) e,
iv. ST (i) A (ili) FTEFA TN (E H) e

8 *F) FTRTF ATF M AL 70 aT T SATRTE oo =1 CEl
(@) =fT g, ar Fghe #=1 aqied &9 F U gawrd g Rdw gwer o w7 f
R
(1) Heg IO |.UGSI 1T, 14 7T T (9T dehed aTieret 7 o6 1T
9. *(F) Fa1 fAgh =af=h #1 set V% wir- 1 sfeafea frft srferfaam & sroaedt a7 adt zgemm
TAT N e, 1 VRO CEl

(@) AT T, TV F75 TR T ATATET ATH FA AT TG

10.*(F) T 9 |97 & 3% g Re F oo aeeat § e e marar E1 A CEl
(@) =T g, a7 FoheT 9T T T T e
(T) T . THS{IET. 14 7 THART (T oo q g1t T8 o6 ToT0). e

11.* (%) a1 s =afxr 1 srfafRem Y g 164 % aga Mt f Fgle F o e afvg
ER IR ) i, E-1 IO SEl

LEELC]

1) *aTe H@ehed T I (He T F)

2) TR % Hehed T g (6 &%)

3) g FCHIT F AATEA T 9fd, afs #1821 (He v )

4) wergr [Ager/quiTers Rer/aee % =7 § F1 F:39 g Fgafa-o7 (He T )

5) SOt T ATETRT o qriee T aief T g@ swerr F yarores fi wia, afE w2 g1 FueT A
arfestae {1 3 srgETe arfeataes fear s @ 8 (He v FY)

6) SFfoTF FeuF, Af2 L &l (Fw 7



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

F ot T e o F HheT WAoo ARG . FRT T8 YO 9T gEdqTes
T % TorT TTfera g 9T 78 T FLaT g 6 30 YO a7 T899 Hag "l S fAuaeeg % w6y §
FoAtr srfafaam, 2013 i 9% qgd aq [t £ gy sroremett 1 9req B 21 § ag oft
IO FXaT g 7o ST <F T 9l g1 39 TOF F HeAwd 99T g, Hel A qut g 9T 39 J9T
H WA T qae TET fRTs e 2

*fesrea geaTaR }Y (Sraadt atw)

* e reh 1 ST, Teree AT HEAr A7 HuwAr w1 Srersu a7 fruua a7 Fadt g £ qeemar
L5z | OO

e X @ A=A grRr -

# 7g =iuq #3ar g & g3 39 T F Y= v R s F e G = )0 uaesm
saTfore BT sitar & & &7 == g Y Ruweeg o sHw gdfta amet F oo daer aferfa,
2013 3T I8F qgd a°TT 70 AT F I’ F7 sreaaw B g o Iwdw fHawoit (derusi 99q)
T TATIT FHIAT FRT T T G Fferat F fBFFam g s o0 g7 1 fugasg g e ag amr g & a
q, AT 3T qOF § qAT 56 T | "Haferd Fre g1 7g! fure 1% g1 & g ff ywrivrg #wwar g &

(®) s Tle stua & & qa o o € St 3 srofera srfarnrdy g gearefa € a9 sy
gferfa, 2013 % A¥1q ITILTHT F SIqHR T T 3 947 Fel 970 U 8,

(@) =l erafer Herrn qut oY TUE w T & T F 191 "o fhu g
*fRsfiew gER +@ ¥

... ATEE AT (TUishToren S &H)aT (STt Ft)

... FTTT AGTHIT (TOTRTIora ST #)ar

...t afea (qotrfers St &)

FT THIAUE AT Hell § ... TAIUE...... &

TEEAAT F oo a7 THTT

AYe: F1RT 448 79T 449 Y AT £ Ry siar § Srd g3 Rewr ¥ g <o aur 93 ag ¥ g
< T 19U gl




[ 9 [I-@vg 3(i)] AT ehl TSTYA ¢ STHERUT 5

THRE HAT AT " (THIHUA) e T —wE WHT WA A aRw
...................... (fem/aTR ad)

TH - AT TAEEIT OISt AT SI7aT 8

[T. ¥.1/5/2013-F10=-V]
froqure- g e W F TS, AT, aR-11, 9s-3, 3uET (i) 7 9L R 249(3) ardie 31

AT, 2014 T TS B30 10 3 $fie srferg=mT s |r.#1.f4.390(e7) arda 09 [, 2014 5T
I TETAaT HOee AT =T o

MINISTRY OF CORPORATE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 30" June, 2016

G.S.R. 646(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 469 of the Companies
Act, 2013 (18 of 2013), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Companies
(Appointment and Remuneration of Managerial Personnel) Rules, 2014, namely:—

1. (1) These rules may be called the Companies (Appointment and Remuneration of Managerial Personnel) Amendment
Rules, 2016.

(2) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Companies (Appointment and Remuneration of Managerial Personnel) Rules, 2014,
(hereinafter referred to as the principal rules),-

(i) in rule 3, the expression“Chief Executive Officer (CEO), Company Secretary and Chief Financial Officer
(CFO)” shall be omitted.

3. inrule 5 of the principal rules,-
(a) in sub-rule (1), “clauses (v), (vi), (vii) and (ix) to (xi)” shall be omitted.
(b) in sub-rule (2),-
(a

for the words * the name of every employee of the company, who-", the words *“ the names of the top ten
employees in terms of remuneration drawn and the name of every employee, who-"" shall be substituted;

=

(b) in sub-clause (i) for the words “sixty lakh rupees”, the words “one crore and two lakh rupees” shall be
substituted;

in sub-clause (ii) for the words “five lakh rupees per month”, the words “ eight lakh and fifty thousand
rupees per month” shall be substituted;

(c

N



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

For Form MR-1 of the principal rules, the following form shall be substituted, namely.-

Return of appointment of
managerial personnel

Form No. MR-1

[Pursuant to Section 196 read with Section 197 and
Schedule V of the Companies Act and pursuant to Rule 3
of the Companies (Appointment and Remuneration of
Managerial Personnel) Rules 2014]

Form language o English o Hindi
Refer instruction Kit for filing the form.

1.{a) *Corporate identity number (CIN) of company | | Pre-Fill

(b) Global location number (GLN) of company | |

2.(a) Name of the company

(b) Address of the
registered office
of the company

3.(a) *Director identification number (DIN) or income-tax permanent account

number (PAN) or membership number

(b) *Name

4. *Designation o Manager o Managing Director o Whole Time Director

5.7 Date of the resolution by the board of directors |:| (DD/MMIYYYY)
6. * Effective date of appointment |:| (DDIMMIYYYY)

7. Terms and conditions including remuneration-

(a) Remuneration @) Per month O Per Annum

i, Salary (In Rs) | |

ii. Perquisites (In Rs.) | |
iii. Others (In Rs.)
iv. Total of (i) to (iii) (In Rs.)

(b)* Tenure of appointment From l:l (DDMMAYYYY)

(c) Other terms, if any




[ 9 [I-@vg 3(i)] AT ehl TSTYA ¢ STHERUT 7

8. *(a) Whether the age of the appointee is more than 70 years O Yes O No
(b) If yes, date of passing of special resolution by the shareholders approving the appointment :
(c) SRN of related Form No. MGT-14 (for filing of Special Resolution) | |

9. *(a) Whether the appointee had been convicted or detained under any of the Acts mentioned inPart I of
Schedule V

O Yes ONo
(b) If yes, Date of obtaining Central Government’s approval I:l

10. *(a) Whether the approval for such appointment has been obtained from the members in general meeting O Yes
O No
(b) If yes, date of passing the resolution
(c) SRN of Form No. MGT-14 (for filing of Special Resoluliol

11. * (a) Whether the appointee has been disqualified for appointment of director under section 164 of the ActO
Yes O No
(b)If yes, give details

Attachments
1) *Copy of Board resolution; Attach
2) Copy of shareholders resolution; Attach
3) Copy of the Central government approval, if Attach
any; Attach

4)*Copy of letter of consent to act as Managing
Director/Whole time Director/Manager;

5) Copy of certificate by the Nomination and

Remuneration Committee of the company, if any,
to the effect that the remuneration is as per
-
remuneration policy of the company
6) Optional attachments, if any.

Declaration
I am authorized by the Board of Directors of the Company vide resolution no.* dated*
to sign this form and declare that all the requirements of Companies Act, 2013 and the rules made thereunder in
respect of the subject matter of this form and matters incidental thereto have been complied with. I also declare that all
the information given herein above is true, correct and complete including the attachments to this form and nothing
material has been suppressed.

*To be digitally signed by DSC

*Designation

*DIN of the director; or DIN or PAN of the manager or CEO or CFO; or
Membership number of the company secretary




8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

Certificate by practicing professional

I declare that I have been duly engaged for the purpose of certification of this form. It is hereby certified that I have
gone through the provisions of the Companies Act, 2013 and Rules thereunder for the subject matter of this form and
matters incidental thereto and I have verified the above particulars (including attachment(s)) from the original records
maintained by the Company which is subject matter of this form and found them to be true, correct and complete and
no information material to this form has been suppressed. I further certify that;

a. The said records have been properly prepared, signed by the required officers of the Company and maintained

as per the relevant provisions of the Companies Act, 2013 and were found to be in order;

b. All the required attachments have been completely and legibly attached to this form.

*To be digitally signed by
0 Chartered accountant (in whole-time practice) or DSC BOX
o Cost accountant (in whole-time practice) or

o Company secretary (in whole-time practice)
‘Whether associate or fellow o Associate o Fellow
Membership number | ] Certificate of Practise number [

Note: Attention is drawn to provisions of Section 448 and 449 which provide for punishment for false
t / certificate and punishment for false evidence respectively.

For office use only: ‘ Affix filing details ‘

eForm Service request number (SRN) |:| eForm filing date |:| (DDIMM/YYYY)

This e-Form is hereby registered

Digital signature of the authorising officer Confirm submission |

[F. No. 1/5/2013 CL-V]
AMARDEEP SINGH BHATIA, Jt. Secy.

Note: —The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part-II, Section 3, sub-section (i), vide
number G.S.R. 249(E), dated the 31st March, 2014 and subsequently amended vide notification number G.S.R. 390(E)
dated 09.06.2014.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



